Bid Tabulation

ITB 47-20 Residential Housing Rehabilitation Services

Regina Johnson, Principal Buyer
johnsonre@jccal.org

PROJECT

ACOFF CONSTRUCTION

DWR

S&W

UNCH

GRAND TOTAL

$ 68,957.00

6,475.00

39,250.00

67,400.00

Cathy Pierce

604 Westwood Ave.
Adamsville, AL 35005
Phone: 205-433-4129
Case #: 18-PC-1

$ 13,056.00

NO

BID

9,800.00

14,140.00

Lula Mims

4110 Bethany Ave.
Brighton, AL 35020
Phone: 205-425-0072
Case #: 19-2-2

$ 15,661.00

3,900.00

NO BID

18,500.00

Rosalind Davis

204 Jerry Coleman Street
Fairfield, AL 35064
Phone: 205-760-4969
Case #: 19-7-1

$ 32,240.00

NO

BID

29,450.00

24,675.00

Cosandra Taylor

1036 Felix Drive
Birmingham, AL 35214
Phone: 205-706-0818
Case #: 19-12-1

$ 8,000.00

2,575.00

NO BID

10,085.00

Bernice Baynes

121 Woods Ave.
Adamsville, AL 35005
Phone: 205-674-1255
Case #: 20-3-1

NO BID

NO

BID

39,300.00

29,025.00

Johnnie Johnson

324 62nd Street
Fairfield, AL 35064
Phone: 205-786-1439
Case #: 20-6-1

$ 40,200.00

3,575.00

24,950.00

23,250.00

Marry Morrow

4221 School Street
Adamsville, AL 35005
Phone: 205-674-7745
Case #: 20-11-1

$ 22,500.00

NO

BID

24,700.00

21,880.00

Wonder Threadford
1890 McDavid Street
Tarrant, AL 35020
Phone: 205-601-4099
Case #: 20-17-4

NO BID

NO

BID

21,700.00

23,840.00

Sandra Walsh

636 Reba Street
Birmingham, AL 35214
Phone: 205-798-2951
Case #: 20-19-1

NO BID

NO

BID

14,000.00

14,310.00

Emma Pruitt

2064 Lane Ave.
Tarrant, AL 35217
Phone: 205-585-0925
Case #: 20-PE-4

NO BID

NO

BID

NO BID

34,850.00

Fay Ray

412 52nd Street
Fairfield, AL 35064
Phone: 205-637-3870
Case #: 20-RF-1

$ 15,100.00

NO

BID

NO BID

17,570.00

REQUIRED FORMS

Notice of Intent to Respond

YES

YES

YES

YES

Debarment Statement

YES

YES

YES

YES

Non-Collusion Affidavit

YES

YES

YES

YES

Equal Employment Opportunity C

YES

YES

YES

YES

Affidavit of Contractor

YES

YES

YES

YES

Signature Sheet

YES

YES

YES

YES

Contractors Cert. Regarding Debal

YES

YES

YES

YES

Price Sheets

YES

YES

YES

YES

CONTACT INFORMATION

ACOFF CONSTRUCTION CO., IN(

1924 17th St. N., Bessemer, AL 35020 | Roosevelt Acoff, Sr. P: 205.424.6358 E: acoffconstruction@gmail.com

DWR CONSTRUCTION

1020 Springview St., Birmingham, AL | William J. Donner P: 404.663.7825  E: williamdnnr709@gmail.com

S & W CONSTRUCTION, LLC

150 Tyler Rd., Remlap, AL 35133 | Shane Shirley P: 205.568.0879 E: shanedshirley4@gmail.com

UNCH, INC.

524 4th Avenue N., | Birmingham, AL 35204 | Michael Raby P:205.581.1688 E: unch524@gmail.com

Prepared By: Latoria Kenniebrew 6.24.2020, R. Johnson 7.2.2020
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